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Terms & Conditions: 
1. Two people allowed per voucher. 2. You must produce valid National Express Coach tickets 
equivalent to the number of persons requiring entry (Oyster cards are not valid). 3. Offers are valid 
until 31 January 2019 unless offer states otherwise. 4. Amended or defaced vouchers will not be 
accepted. 5. Acceptance of this voucher is strictly subject to the establishment’s own terms & 
conditions and deemed accepted on admission. 6. Prices are subject to change without notice 
and are correct at time of publication. 7. Offers may be withdrawn or subject to change without 
notice. 8. Exchange or sale of this voucher is prohibited. Not for resale. Voucher value 0.0001p.  
9. Special terms & conditions may apply and will be stated clearly on the National Express 
website. 10. Offer valid on full price adult tickets only. An adult is 16 years or over. 11. In the event  
of a full price and concessionary admission ticket being purchased together, the higher price ticket 
must be paid for. 12. This voucher must be used at the time of purchase and is not valid for any 
pre-booked tickets (unless specified otherwise). 13. This voucher cannot be used with any other 
promotion, offer, individual or group discount. 14. Restrictions and Non-Availability: Coca-Cola 
London Eye: Excludes 14 Feb, 30 Mar-2 Apr, 21, 22, 28, 29 July; 4, 5, 11, 12 Aug; 22, 23, 25, 
29, 30, 31 Dec (NB: A further two weeks will be excluded in Jan ’19 due to maintenance. Check 
website for details); London Bridge Experience: Closed 25 Dec; The London Dungeon: Not valid 
26-27 Oct, 25 Dec. Dreamworks Tours: Shrek’s Adventure!: Excludes 25 Dec. Tower of London: 
Excludes between 26 Mar and 9 Apr, 16 Jul–7 Sep, 24-26 Dec & 1 Jan. Westminster Abbey: 
Excludes 1 Jan, 23 Mar-14 Apr; 16 Jul-1 Sep; Special Wednesday evening events. 15. All Merlin 
Entertainments attractions (Coca-Cola London Eye; The London Dungeon; Madame Tussauds, 
London; SEA LIFE London; Dreamworks Tours: Shrek’s Adventure! London) are closed on 25 
Dec, for full terms & conditions please visit nationalexpress.com/2for1

Please complete before arriving at the venue

Name:

Attraction:

Date of travel:                                                                                D   D   M   M   Y    Y

Two for one 
London 
attractions
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Travel together and visit the capital’s top attractions for less
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